
Legal Notices-CC
FICTITIOUS

BUSINESS NAME
STATEMENT
2022-107379

The following person is
doing business as:
P L U S  U P , 5 7 1 0
CRESCENT PARK E
A P T 4 3 4 , P L A Y A
VISTA, CA 90094. Re-
gistered Owners: PLUS
UP TECHNOLOGIES,
LLC, 5710 CRES-
CENT PARK E APT
434, PLAYA VISTA,
CA 90094. This busi-
ness is conducted by:
LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY. The date
registrant started to
transact business un-
der the fictitious busi-
ness name or names
listed above: 04/2021.
Signed: BRIAN VI-
CENTE, CEO. This
statement was fi led
with the County Re-
c o r d e r O f f i c e :
05/17/2022. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Culver  Ci ty  News
5 / 2 6 , 6 / 2 , 9 , 1 6 / 2 2 -
1 1 8 8 4 1

Legal Notices-CC

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
22SMCP00210

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
ALEXANDRA PAGE
WHITE filed a petition
with this court for a de-
cree changing names
as follows: ALEXAN-
DRA PAGE WHITE to
ALESSANDRA NA-
O M I W H I T E . T H E
COURT ORDERS that
all persons interested
in this matter shall ap-
pear before this court
at the hearing indic-
ated below to show
cause, if any, why the
petition for change of
name should not be
granted. Any person
objecting to the name
changes descr ibed
above must file a writ-
ten objection that in-
cludes the reasons for
the objection at least
two court days before
the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and
must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

07/15/2022
8:30 a.m., Dept. K

Los Angeles Superior
Court

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica, CA

90401
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News
DATE: 05/23/2022
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the
Superior Court:
Culver City News
6/9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2022-
119479

FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2022-109033

The following person is
doing business as: IM-
PACTFUL  MARKET,
2865 REYNIER AVEN-
UE, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90034. Registered
Owners: ELISHA C.
LLC, 2865 REYNIER
A V E N U E , L O S
ANGELES, CA 90034.
This business is con-
ducted by: LIMITED LI-
ABILITY COMPANY.
The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
0 5 / 2 0 2 2 . S i g n e d :
ELISHA CHAN, CEO.
This statement was
filed with the County
R e c o r d e r O f f i c e :
05/18/2022. Notice —
This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/2,9,16,23/22-119336

Legal Notices-CC

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
22SMCP00210

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
ALEXANDRA PAGE
WHITE filed a petition
with this court for a de-
cree changing names
as follows: ALEXAN-
DRA PAGE WHITE to
ALESSANDRA NA-
O M I W H I T E . T H E
COURT ORDERS that
all persons interested
in this matter shall ap-
pear before this court
at the hearing indic-
ated below to show
cause, if any, why the
petition for change of
name should not be
granted. Any person
objecting to the name
changes descr ibed
above must file a writ-
ten objection that in-
cludes the reasons for
the objection at least
two court days before
the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and
must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

07/15/2022
8:30 a.m., Dept. K

Los Angeles Superior
Court

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica, CA

90401
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News
DATE: 05/23/2022
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the
Superior Court:
Culver City News
6/9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2022-
119479

Legal Notices-CC

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
22SMCP00224

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
MANUEL GREGORY
VALTIERRA filed a pe-
tition with this court for
a decree changing
names as fo l lows :
MANUEL GREGORY
V A L T I E R R A t o
GREGORY MANUEL
VALTIERRA III. THE
COURT ORDERS that
all persons interested
in this matter shall ap-
pear before this court
at the hearing indic-
ated below to show
cause, if any, why the
petition for change of
name should not be
granted. Any person
objecting to the name
changes descr ibed
above must file a writ-
ten objection that in-
cludes the reasons for
the objection at least
two court days before
the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and
must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

07/22/2022
8:30 a.m., Dept. K

Los Angeles Superior
Court

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica, CA

90401
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News
DATE: 05/31/2022
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the
Superior Court:
Culver City News
6/9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2022-
119478

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
22SMCP00210

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
ALEXANDRA PAGE
WHITE filed a petition
with this court for a de-
cree changing names
as follows: ALEXAN-
DRA PAGE WHITE to
ALESSANDRA NA-
O M I W H I T E . T H E
COURT ORDERS that
all persons interested
in this matter shall ap-
pear before this court
at the hearing indic-
ated below to show
cause, if any, why the
petition for change of
name should not be
granted. Any person
objecting to the name
changes descr ibed
above must file a writ-
ten objection that in-
cludes the reasons for
the objection at least
two court days before
the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and
must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

07/15/2022
8:30 a.m., Dept. K

Los Angeles Superior
Court

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica, CA

90401
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News
DATE: 05/23/2022
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the
Superior Court:
Culver City News
6/9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2022-
119479

Legal Notices-CC

NOTICE
Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
ated: RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; DEBRA DAVIS;
E L I S A B E T H
HARNOIS; JOSE CAS-
TELLANOS; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
C H R I S T O P H E R
H A M P T O N ; B A R -
BARA EFFROS; BAR-
BARA EFFROS; MI-
CHAEL HILL; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
STEVE WALPERT.
5450 S Slauson Ave
Culver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 28th, 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bids and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987248 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119458

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO.
22SMCP00224

TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
MANUEL GREGORY
VALTIERRA filed a pe-
tition with this court for
a decree changing
names as fo l lows :
MANUEL GREGORY
V A L T I E R R A t o
GREGORY MANUEL
VALTIERRA III. THE
COURT ORDERS that
all persons interested
in this matter shall ap-
pear before this court
at the hearing indic-
ated below to show
cause, if any, why the
petition for change of
name should not be
granted. Any person
objecting to the name
changes descr ibed
above must file a writ-
ten objection that in-
cludes the reasons for
the objection at least
two court days before
the matter is sched-
uled to be heard and
must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

07/22/2022
8:30 a.m., Dept. K

Los Angeles Superior
Court

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica, CA

90401
A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News
DATE: 05/31/2022
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the
Superior Court:
Culver City News
6/9 ,16 ,23 ,30 /2022-
119478

Legal Notices-CC

NOTICE
Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
ated: RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; DEBRA DAVIS;
E L I S A B E T H
HARNOIS; JOSE CAS-
TELLANOS; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
C H R I S T O P H E R
H A M P T O N ; B A R -
BARA EFFROS; BAR-
BARA EFFROS; MI-
CHAEL HILL; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
STEVE WALPERT.
5450 S Slauson Ave
Culver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 6th , 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bids and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987415 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119424

NOTICE
Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
ated: RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; DEBRA DAVIS;
E L I S A B E T H
HARNOIS; JOSE CAS-
TELLANOS; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
C H R I S T O P H E R
H A M P T O N ; B A R -
BARA EFFROS; BAR-
BARA EFFROS; MI-
CHAEL HILL; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
STEVE WALPERT.
5450 S Slauson Ave
Culver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 28th, 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bids and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987248 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culv er  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119458

Legal Notices-CC

NOTICE
Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
a t e d : E l i z a b e t h
Harnois, Household
items; Ralph Berlinski,
Household items; Dav-
id Allen Green, House-
hold items; Christoph-
er Hampton, House-
hold Tools; Barbara Ef-
fros, Household items;
Debra Lynne Davis,
Household items; Ral-
ph Berlinski, House-
hold items; Jose Cas-
tellanos, Household
items; Barbara Effros,
Household items; Dav-
id Allen Green, House-
ho ld i t ems ; S teve
Walpert, Household
i tems; Michael Hi l l ,
Household items. 5450
S. Slauson Ave., Cul-
ver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 28th, 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bid and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987400 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119406

NOTICE
Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
ated: RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; RALPH BERLIN-
SKI; DEBRA DAVIS;
E L I S A B E T H
HARNOIS; JOSE CAS-
TELLANOS; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
C H R I S T O P H E R
H A M P T O N ; B A R -
BARA EFFROS; BAR-
BARA EFFROS; MI-
CHAEL HILL; DAVID
A L L E N G R E E N ;
STEVE WALPERT.
5450 S Slauson Ave
Culver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 6th , 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bids and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987415 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119424

Legal Notices-CC
NOTICE

Extra Space Storage
will hold a public auc-
tion to sell personal
property described be-
low belonging to those
individuals listed below
at the location indic-
a t e d : E l i z a b e t h
Harnois, Household
items; Ralph Berlinski,
Household items; Dav-
id Allen Green, House-
hold items; Christoph-
er Hampton, House-
hold Tools; Barbara Ef-
fros, Household items;
Debra Lynne Davis,
Household items; Ral-
ph Berlinski, House-
hold items; Jose Cas-
tellanos, Household
items; Barbara Effros,
Household items; Dav-
id Allen Green, House-
ho ld i t ems ; S teve
Walpert, Household
i tems; Michael Hi l l ,
Household items. 5450
S. Slauson Ave., Cul-
ver City, CA 90230;
(424) 532-5448 on
June 28th, 2022 at
12:45 PM. Purchases
must be made with
cash only and paid at
the above referenced
facility in order to com-
plete the transaction.
Extra Space Storage
may refuse any bid and
may rescind any pur-
chase up until the win-
ning bidder takes pos-
session of the person-
al property. The auc-
tion will be listed and
a d v e r t i s e d o n
www.storagetreasures.
com. Purchases must
be made with cash only
and paid at the above
referenced facility in or-
der to complete the
t r a n s a c t i o n . E x t r a
Space Storage may re-
fuse any bid and may
rescind any purchase
up until the winning
bidder takes posses-
sion of the personal
property.
CN987400 06-28-2022
Jun 9,16, 2022
Culver  Ci ty  News
6/9,16/2022-119406


