
Legal Notices-CC
NOTICE TO

CREDITORS OF
BULK SALE AND OF

INTENTION TO
TRANSFER
ALCOHOLIC

BEVERAGE LICENSE
(UCC 6101 et seq.

and B & P 24073 and
24074 et seq.)

Escrow No.
009343-JK

Notice is hereby given
that a bulk sale of as-
sets and a transfer of
alcoholic beverage li-
cense is about to be
made. The names, So-
cial Security or Feder-
al Tax Numbers, and
a d d r e s s o f t h e
Seller/Licensee are: D
& S KIM, INC, 3859
O V E R L A N D A V E ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232
The business is known
a s : Y O K O H A M A
S U S H I
The names, Social Se-
curity or Federal Tax
Numbers , and ad-
d r e s s e s o f t h e
Buyer/Transferee are:
88 KOPAN RAMEN,
INC. , 3859 OVER-
LAND AVE, CULVER
CITY, CA 90232
A s l i s t e d b y t h e
Seller/Licensee, all oth-
er business names and
addresses used by the
Seller/Licensee within
three years before the
date such list was sent
or delivered to the Buy-
e r /T rans fe ree a re :
NONE
The assets to be sold
are described in gener-
al as: FURNITURE,
FIXTURES, EQUIP-
MENT, TRADENAME,
GOODWILL, LEASE,
L E A S E H O L D I M -
PROVEMENT and are
l o c a t e d a t : 3 8 5 9
O V E R L A N D A V E ,
CULVER CITY, CA
90232
The kind of license to
be transferred is: ON-
S A L E B E E R A N D
W I N E - E A T I N G
PLACE , License # 41-
401784 now issued for
the premises located
at: 3859 OVERLAND
AVE, CULVER CITY,
CA 90232
The anticipated date of
the sale/transfer is JU-
LY 16, 2018 at the of-
fice of: UNITED ES-
C R O W C O , 3 6 0 0
W I L S H I R E B L V D
#913, LOS ANGELES,
CA 90010.
The amount of the pur-
chase price or consid-
eration in connection
with the transfer of the
license and business,
including estimated in-
ventory, is the sum of
$252,000.00, which
consists of the follow-
ing: DESCRIPTION,
AMOUNT: CHECKS
DEPOSITED INTO ES-
CROW BY BUYER
$252,000.00
It has been agreed
between the Seller/Li-
censee and the inten-
ded Buyer/Transferee,
as required by Sec.
24073 of the Business
and Professions Code,
that the consideration
for the transfer of the
business and license is
to be paid only after the
transfer has been ap-
proved by the Depart-
men t o f A l coho l i c
Beve rage Con t ro l .
Dated: JUNE 4, 2018
D & S KIM, INC, ,
Se l le r /L icensee
88 KOPAN RAMEN,
INC., Buyer/Transferee
LA2042685  CULVER
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SUMMONS
(CITACION
JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER
(Numero del Caso)

BC690022
NOTICE TO

DEFENDANT:
(Aviso al

Demandado):
ZEALOT NETWORKS,

INC., A California
Corporation;

MICHAEL HARMON,
an individual; DANNY
ZAPPIN, an individual

YOU ARE BEING
SUED BY PLAINTIFF:

(Lo esta
demandando el
demandante)

HARRISON JAMES
DUNNETT, by and

through His
Successors in

interest and parents,
Gail and Warwick

Dunnett;
GAIL DUNNETT,
individually; and

WARWICK JAMES
DUNNETT,

individually;
BREANNE BLESSE,

an individual
NOTICE! You have
been sued. The court
may decide against
you without your being
heard unless you re-
spond within 30 days.
Read the information
below.
You have 30 calendar
days after this sum-
mons and legal papers
are served on you to
file a written response
at this court and have a
copy served on the
plainti f f . A letter or
phone call will not pro-
tect you. Your written
response must be in
proper legal form if you
want the court to hear
your case. There may
be a court form that
you can use for your
response. You can find
these court forms and
more information at the
California Courts On-
line Self-Help Center
(www. courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), your county
law library, or the court-
house nearest you. If
you cannot pay the fil-
ing fee, ask the court
clerk for a fee waiver
form. If you do not file
your response on time,
you may lose the case
by default, and your
wages, money, and
property may be taken
without further warning
from the court.
There are other legal
requirements. You may
want to call an attor-
ney right away. If you
do not know an attor-
ney, you may want to
call an attorney refer-
ral service. If you can-
not afford an attorney,
you may be eligible for
free legal services from
a nonprofit legal ser-
vices program. You
can locate these non-
profit groups at the
California Legal Ser-
v i c e s W e b s i t e
(www.law helpcalifor-
nia.org), the California
Courts Online Self-
H e l p C e n t e r
( w w w . c o u r t i n f o . c a .
gov/selfhelp), or by
contacting your local
court of county bar as-
sociation. NOTE: The
court has a statutory li-
en for waived fees and
costs on any settle-
men t or arbi t rat ion
award of $10,000.00 or
more in a civil case.
The court's lien must
be paid before the
court will dismiss the
case.
AVISO! Lo han de-
mandado. Si no re-
sponde dentro de 30
dias, la corte puede de-
cidir en su contra sin
escuchar su version.
Lea la informacion a
continuacion.
Tiene 30 dias de calen-
dario despues de que
le en t reguen es ta
citacion y papeles le-
gales para presentar
una respuesta por es-
crito en esta corte y
hacer que se entregue
una copia al demand-
ante. Una carta o una
llamada telefonica no
l o p r o t e g e n . S u
respuesta por escrito
t iene que estar en
formato legal correcto
si desea que procesen
su caso en la corte. Es
posible que haya un
formularlo que usted
pueda usar su re-
puesta. Puede encon-
trar estos formularios
de la corte y mas in-
formacion en el Centro
de Ayunda de las Cor-
t e s d e C a l i f o r n i a
(www.sucorte.ca.gov),
en la bibl ioteca de
leyes de su condado o
en la corte que le
quede mas cerca. Si
no puede pagar la
cuota de presentacion,
pida al secretario de la
corte que le de un for-
mularlo de exencion de
pago de cuotas. Si no
presenta su respuesta
a tiempo, puede per-
der el caso por incump-
limiento y la corte le
podra quitar su sueldo,
dinero y blenes sin
mas advertencia.
Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomend-
able que llame a un
abogado inmediata-
mente. Si no conoce a
un abogado, puede
llamar a un servicio de
remision a abogados.
Si no puede pagar a un
abogado, es posible
que cumpla con los re-
quisitos para obtener
servicios legales gratui-
tos de un programa de
servicios legales sin
fines de lucro. Puede
encontrar estos grupos
sin fines de lucro en el
sitio web de California
L e g a l S e r v i c e s ,
(www.lawhelpcalifornia,
org), en el Centro de
Ayunda de las Cortes
de California, (www.su-
c o r t e . c a . g o v ) o
poniendose en con-
tacto con la corte o el
colegio de abogados
locales.
AVISO! Por ley, la
corte tiene derecho a
reclamar las cuotas y
los costos exentos por
imponer un gravamen
sobre cualquier recu-
p e r a c i o n d e
$10,000.00 o mas de
valor recibida medi-
ante un acuerdo o una
concesion de arbitraje
en un caso de derecho
civil. Tiene que pagar
el gravamen de la corte
antes de que la corte
pueda desechar el
caso.
The name and ad-
dress of the court is (El
nombre y dirección de
la corte es): Superior
Court  of  California,
Stanley  Mosk Court-
house, 111 North Hill
Street,  Los  Angeles,
CA  90012.
The name, address,
and telephone number
of plaintiff’s attorney, or
plaintiff without an at-
torney, is (El nombre,
dirección y el número
d e t e l é f o n o d e l
abogado del demand-
ante, o del demand-
ante que no t iene
abogado, es): Robert
Montes, 10100 Santa
Monica Blvd., #300,
L o s A n g e l e s , C A
9 0 0 6 7
Date: JAN 16 2018
Sherri R. Carter
Clerk, by (Secretario)
Shaunya Bolden
Deputy (Adjunto)
Culver  City  News-
5/31,6/7,14,21/2018-
65209
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NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE Trustee
S a l e N o . :
00000007070691 Title
Order No.: 170372983
FHA/VA/PMI No.: AT-
TENTION RECORD-
ER: THE FOLLOW-
ING REFERENCE TO
AN ATTACHED SUM-
MARY APPLIES ONLY
T O C O P I E S
PROVIDED TO THE
TRUSTOR, NOT TO
T H I S R E C O R D E D
ORIGINAL NOTICE.
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST,
DATED 06/11/1992.
UNLESS YOU TAKE
ACTION TO PRO-
TECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE
SOLD AT A PUBLIC
SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. BARRETT
DAFFIN FRAPPIER
TREDER and WEISS,
LLP, as duly appointed
Trustee under and pur-
suant to Deed of Trust
R e c o r d e d o n
06/24/1992 as Instru-
ment No. 92 1155515
of official records in the
office of the County
R e c o r d e r o f L O S
ANGELES Coun ty ,
State of CALIFORNIA.
E X E C U T E D B Y :
CHARLES H. BROWN,
A N U N M A R R I E D
MAN, WILL SELL AT
PUBLIC AUCTION TO
HIGHEST BIDDER
F O R C A S H ,
C A S H I E R ' S
CHECK/CASH EQUI-
VALENT or other form
of payment authorized
by California Civil Code
2924h(b), (payable at
time of sale in lawful
money of the United
Sta tes) . DATE OF
SALE: 07 /05 /2018
TIME OF SALE: 9:00
AM PLACE OF SALE:
DOUBLETREE HOTEL
LOS ANGELES-NOR-
WALK, 13111 SYCA-
MORE DRIVE, NOR-
W A L K , C A
90650.STREET AD-
DRESS and other com-
mon designation, i f
any, of the real prop-
erty described above is
purported to be:4810
HOLLOW CORNER
ROAD NO 142, CUL-
VER CITY, CALIFOR-
N I A 9 0 2 3 0 A P N # :
4296-010-071 PAR-
CEL 1: A CONDOMINI-
UM COMPRISED OF
THE FOLLOWING: A)
A N U N D I V I D E D
1/140TH INTEREST IN
AND TO LOTS 17, 19
AND 20 OF TRACT
NO. 34443, IN THE
CITY OF CULVER
CITY, COUNTY OF
L O S A N G E L E S ,
STATE OF CALIFOR-
NIA, AS PER MAP
FILED IN BOOK 898
PAGES 65 TO 70 IN-
CLUSIVE OF MAPS,
IN THE OFFICE OF
THE COUNTY RE-
CORDER OF SAID
COUNTY. EXCEPT
FROM SAID LOTS 17,
19 AND 20 UNITS 1
TO 140 INCLUSIVE
AS SHOWN ON THE
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN, RECORDED
OCTOBER 12, 1978
AS INSTRUMENT NO.
78-1132085,OFFICIAL
RECORDS. EXCEPT-
ING THEREFROM ALL
MINERALS, ORES,
PRECIOUS AND USE-
FUL METALS,SUB-
STANCES AND HY-
DROCARBONS OF
EVERY KIND AND
C H A R A C T E R , I N -
CLUDING PETRO-
LEUM, OIL, GAS, AS-
PHALTUM AND TAR,
THAT MAY NOW OR
H E R E A F T E R B E
FOUND, LOCATED,
C O N T A I N E D , D E -
VELOPED OR TAKEN
ON, IN, UNDER OR
FROM SAID LAND,
O R A N Y P A R T
THEREOF, WITHOUT
H O W E V E R , A N Y
RIGHT OF SURFACE
E N T R Y O R A N Y
RIGHT OF ENTRY TO
THE SUBSURFACE
T H E R E O F T O A
DEPTH OF 500 FEET
BENEATH THE SUR-
FACE OF SAID PROP-
ERTY FOR THE DE-
VELOPMENT, RE-
MOVAL OR OTHER
EXPLOITATION OF
SAID MINERALS AND
O T H E R S U B -
STANCES(B) UNIT 71
AS SHOWN ON SAID
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN. PARCEL 2: AN
EXCLUSIVE EASE-
MENT FOR PARKING
A N D I N C I D E N T A L
PURPOSES OVER
PARKING SPACES C-
723 AND C-724 AS
SHOWN ON SAID
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN. The under -
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address and
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will
be made, but without
covenant or warranty,
e x p r e s s e d o r
implied,regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum
of the note(s) secured
by said Deed of Trust,
with interest thereon,
as provided in said
note(s), advances, un-
der the terms of said
Deed of Trust, fees,
charges and expenses
of the Trustee and of
the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust. The
total amount of the un-
paid balance of the ob-
ligation secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable estimated
costs, expenses and
advances at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale is
$47,878.67. The bene-
ficiary under said Deed
of Trust heretofore ex-
ecuted and delivered to
the undersigned a writ-
ten Declaration of De-
fault and Demand for
Sale, and a written No-
t ice of Default and
Election to Sell. The
undersigned caused
said Notice of Default
and Election to Sell to
be recorded in the
county where the real
property is located.
NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you
are considering bid-
ding on this property li-
en, you should under-
stand that there are
risks involved in bid-
ding at a trustee auc-
tion. You will be bid-
ding on a lien, not on
the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at
a trustee auction does
not automatically en-
title you to free and
clear ownership of the
property. You should
also be aware that the
lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If
you are the highest bid-
der at the auction, you
are or may be respons-
ible for paying off all li-
ens senior to the lien
being auctioned off, be-
fore you can receive
clear title to the prop-
erty. You are encour-
aged to investigate the
existence, priority, and
size of outstanding li-
ens that may exist on
this property by con-
tacting the county re-
corder's office or a title
insurance company,
either of which may
charge you a fee for
this information. If you
consult either of these
resources, you should
be aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
800-280-2832 for in-
formation regarding the
trustee's sale or visit
this Internet Web site
www.auction.com for
information regarding
the sale of this prop-
erty, using the file num-
ber assigned to this
case 00000007070691.
Information about post-
ponements that are
very short in duration
or that occur close in
time to the scheduled
sale may not immedi-
ately be reflected in the
telephone information
or on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
FOR TRUSTEE SALE
I N F O R M A T I O N
PLEASE CALL:AUC-
TION.COM, LLC 800-
2 8 0 - 2 8 3 2
w w w . a u c t i o n . c o m
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP as
T r u s t e e 2 0 9 5 5
Pathfinder Road, Suite
300 Diamond Bar, CA
91765 (866) 795-1852
Dated : 05 /22 /2018
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP IS
ACTING AS A DEBT
C O L L E C T O R A T -
TEMPTING TO COL-
LECT A DEBT. ANY
INFORMATION OB-
T A I N E D W I L L B E
U S E D F O R T H A T
P U R P O S E . A -
F N 4 6 5 8 4 8 9
0 5 / 3 1 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 0 7 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 1 4 / 2 0 1 8
Culver  City  News-
5 / 3 1 , 6 / 7 , 1 4 / 2 0 1 8 -
6 5 5 5 0

Legal Notices-CC

NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE Trustee
S a l e N o . :
00000007070691 Title
Order No.: 170372983
FHA/VA/PMI No.: AT-
TENTION RECORD-
ER: THE FOLLOW-
ING REFERENCE TO
AN ATTACHED SUM-
MARY APPLIES ONLY
T O C O P I E S
PROVIDED TO THE
TRUSTOR, NOT TO
T H I S R E C O R D E D
ORIGINAL NOTICE.
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST,
DATED 06/11/1992.
UNLESS YOU TAKE
ACTION TO PRO-
TECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE
SOLD AT A PUBLIC
SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. BARRETT
DAFFIN FRAPPIER
TREDER and WEISS,
LLP, as duly appointed
Trustee under and pur-
suant to Deed of Trust
R e c o r d e d o n
06/24/1992 as Instru-
ment No. 92 1155515
of official records in the
office of the County
R e c o r d e r o f L O S
ANGELES Coun ty ,
State of CALIFORNIA.
E X E C U T E D B Y :
CHARLES H. BROWN,
A N U N M A R R I E D
MAN, WILL SELL AT
PUBLIC AUCTION TO
HIGHEST BIDDER
F O R C A S H ,
C A S H I E R ' S
CHECK/CASH EQUI-
VALENT or other form
of payment authorized
by California Civil Code
2924h(b), (payable at
time of sale in lawful
money of the United
Sta tes) . DATE OF
SALE: 07 /05 /2018
TIME OF SALE: 9:00
AM PLACE OF SALE:
DOUBLETREE HOTEL
LOS ANGELES-NOR-
WALK, 13111 SYCA-
MORE DRIVE, NOR-
W A L K , C A
90650.STREET AD-
DRESS and other com-
mon designation, i f
any, of the real prop-
erty described above is
purported to be:4810
HOLLOW CORNER
ROAD NO 142, CUL-
VER CITY, CALIFOR-
N I A 9 0 2 3 0 A P N # :
4296-010-071 PAR-
CEL 1: A CONDOMINI-
UM COMPRISED OF
THE FOLLOWING: A)
A N U N D I V I D E D
1/140TH INTEREST IN
AND TO LOTS 17, 19
AND 20 OF TRACT
NO. 34443, IN THE
CITY OF CULVER
CITY, COUNTY OF
L O S A N G E L E S ,
STATE OF CALIFOR-
NIA, AS PER MAP
FILED IN BOOK 898
PAGES 65 TO 70 IN-
CLUSIVE OF MAPS,
IN THE OFFICE OF
THE COUNTY RE-
CORDER OF SAID
COUNTY. EXCEPT
FROM SAID LOTS 17,
19 AND 20 UNITS 1
TO 140 INCLUSIVE
AS SHOWN ON THE
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN, RECORDED
OCTOBER 12, 1978
AS INSTRUMENT NO.
78-1132085,OFFICIAL
RECORDS. EXCEPT-
ING THEREFROM ALL
MINERALS, ORES,
PRECIOUS AND USE-
FUL METALS,SUB-
STANCES AND HY-
DROCARBONS OF
EVERY KIND AND
C H A R A C T E R , I N -
CLUDING PETRO-
LEUM, OIL, GAS, AS-
PHALTUM AND TAR,
THAT MAY NOW OR
H E R E A F T E R B E
FOUND, LOCATED,
C O N T A I N E D , D E -
VELOPED OR TAKEN
ON, IN, UNDER OR
FROM SAID LAND,
O R A N Y P A R T
THEREOF, WITHOUT
H O W E V E R , A N Y
RIGHT OF SURFACE
E N T R Y O R A N Y
RIGHT OF ENTRY TO
THE SUBSURFACE
T H E R E O F T O A
DEPTH OF 500 FEET
BENEATH THE SUR-
FACE OF SAID PROP-
ERTY FOR THE DE-
VELOPMENT, RE-
MOVAL OR OTHER
EXPLOITATION OF
SAID MINERALS AND
O T H E R S U B -
STANCES(B) UNIT 71
AS SHOWN ON SAID
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN. PARCEL 2: AN
EXCLUSIVE EASE-
MENT FOR PARKING
A N D I N C I D E N T A L
PURPOSES OVER
PARKING SPACES C-
723 AND C-724 AS
SHOWN ON SAID
C O N D O M I N I U M
PLAN. The under -
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address and
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will
be made, but without
covenant or warranty,
e x p r e s s e d o r
implied,regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum
of the note(s) secured
by said Deed of Trust,
with interest thereon,
as provided in said
note(s), advances, un-
der the terms of said
Deed of Trust, fees,
charges and expenses
of the Trustee and of
the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust. The
total amount of the un-
paid balance of the ob-
ligation secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable estimated
costs, expenses and
advances at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale is
$47,878.67. The bene-
ficiary under said Deed
of Trust heretofore ex-
ecuted and delivered to
the undersigned a writ-
ten Declaration of De-
fault and Demand for
Sale, and a written No-
t ice of Default and
Election to Sell. The
undersigned caused
said Notice of Default
and Election to Sell to
be recorded in the
county where the real
property is located.
NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you
are considering bid-
ding on this property li-
en, you should under-
stand that there are
risks involved in bid-
ding at a trustee auc-
tion. You will be bid-
ding on a lien, not on
the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at
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title you to free and
clear ownership of the
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der at the auction, you
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being auctioned off, be-
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erty. You are encour-
aged to investigate the
existence, priority, and
size of outstanding li-
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this property by con-
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either of which may
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this Internet Web site
www.auction.com for
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erty, using the file num-
ber assigned to this
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verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
FOR TRUSTEE SALE
I N F O R M A T I O N
PLEASE CALL:AUC-
TION.COM, LLC 800-
2 8 0 - 2 8 3 2
w w w . a u c t i o n . c o m
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP as
T r u s t e e 2 0 9 5 5
Pathfinder Road, Suite
300 Diamond Bar, CA
91765 (866) 795-1852
Dated : 05 /22 /2018
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP IS
ACTING AS A DEBT
C O L L E C T O R A T -
TEMPTING TO COL-
LECT A DEBT. ANY
INFORMATION OB-
T A I N E D W I L L B E
U S E D F O R T H A T
P U R P O S E . A -
F N 4 6 5 8 4 8 9
0 5 / 3 1 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 0 7 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 1 4 / 2 0 1 8
Culver  City  News-
5 / 3 1 , 6 / 7 , 1 4 / 2 0 1 8 -
6 5 5 5 0

ORDER TO
SHOW CAUSE FOR
CHANGE OF NAME

CASE NO. BS173639
TO ALL INTERESTED
PERSONS: Petitioner:
JULIA ANN SENECAL
filed a petition with this
cour t for a decree
changing names as fol-
l o w s : J U L I A A N N
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T H E C O U R T O R -
DERS that all persons
interested in this mat-
ter shall appear before
this court at the hear-
ing indicated below to
show cause, if any,
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change of name should
not be granted. Any
person objecting to the
name changes de-
scribed above must file
a written objection that
includes the reasons
for the objection at
least two court days
before the matter is
scheduled to be heard
and must appear at the
hearing to show cause
why the petition should
not be granted. If no
wri t ten object ion is
timely filed, the court
may grant the petition
without a hearing.
NOTICE OF HEARING

July 10, 2018
10:30 a.m., Dept. 44

Room: 418
Superior Court

of California
111 N. Hill St.

Los Angeles, CA
90012

A copy of this Order to
Show Cause shall be
published at least once
each week for four suc-
cessive weeks prior to
the date set for hear-
ing on the petition in
the following newspa-
per of general circula-
t ion, printed in this
county: Culver City
News.
DATE: MAY 17 2018
Edward B. Moreton Jr.
Judge of the
Superior Court
Culver City News
5/31,6/7,14,21/2018-
65765

NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE T.S. No.:
17-01463 Loan No.:
********797 YOU ARE
IN DEFAULT UNDER
A DEED OF TRUST
DATED 11/21/2006
AND MORE FULLY
DESCRIBED BELOW.
UNLESS YOU TAKE
ACTION TO PRO-
TECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE
SOLD AT A PUBLIC
SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. A publ ic
auct ion sale to the
highest bidder for cash,
cashier's check pay-
able at the time of sale
in lawful money of the
United States (payable
to Attorney Lender Ser-
vices, Inc.) will be held
by the duly appointed
Trustee as shown be-
low, of all right, title,
and interest conveyed
to and now held by the
trustee in the herein-
after described prop-
erty under and pursu-
ant to a Deed of Trust
described below. The
sale will be made, but
without covenant or
warranty, expressed or
implied, regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum
of the note(s) secured
by the Deed of Trust,
with interest and late
charges thereon, as
provided in the note(s),
advances, under the
terms of the Deed of
Trust, interest thereon,
fees, charges and ex-
penses of the Trustee
for the total amount (at
the time of the initial
publication of the No-
tice of Sale) reason-
ably estimated to be
set forth below. The
amount may be great-
er on the day of sale.
Trustor: MICHAEL Y.
LEE AND DANIEL Y.
LEE AND YOUNG S.
LEE Trustee: ATTOR-
NEY LENDER SER-
VICES, INC. Recorded
11/29/2006 as Instru-
ment No. 20062636366
of Official Records in
the office of the Re-
c o r d e r o f L O S
ANGELES Coun ty ,
Cal i forn ia, Date of
Sale: 06/28/2018 at
10:00AM Place of Sale:
Behind the fountain
located in Civic Center
Plaza, 400 Civic Cen-
ter Plaza, Pomona CA
91766 Amount of un-
paid balance and other
charges: $663,751.18
The purported prop-
erty address is: 4739
MAYTIME LANE #172
CULVER CITY, CA
90230 A.P.N.: 4296-
014-172 The benefi-
ciary under said Deed
of Trust heretofore ex-
ecuted and delivered to
the undersigned a writ-
ten Declaration of De-
fault and Demand for
Sale and a written No-
t ice of Default and
Election to Sell. The
undersigned caused
said Notice of Default
and Election to Sell to
be recorded in the
county wherein the real
property is located and
more than three (3)
months have elapsed
since such recordation.
The undersigned Trust-
ee disclaims any liabil-
ity for any incorrect-
ness of the property
address or other com-
mon designation, i f
any, shown above. If
no street address or
other common desig-
nation is shown, direc-
tions to the location of
the property may be
obtained by sending a
written request to the
beneficiary within 10
days of the date of first
publication of this No-
tice of Trustee's Sale. If
the Trustee is unable to
convey tit le for any
reason, the successful
bidder's sole and ex-
clusive remedy shall be
the return of monies
paid to the Trustee and
the successful bidder
shall have no further
recourse. NOTICE TO
P O T E N T I A L B I D -
DERS: If you are con-
sidering bidding on this
p roper t y l i en , you
should understand that
there are r isks in-
volved in bidding at a
trustee auction. You
will be bidding on a li-
en, not the property it-
s e l f . P l a c i n g t h e
highest bid at a trustee
auction does not auto-
matically entitle you to
free and clear owner-
ship of the property.
You should also be
aware that the lien be-
ing auctioned off may
be a junior lien. If you
are the highest bidder
at the auction, you are
or may be responsible
for paying off all liens
senior to the lien being
auctioned off, before
you can receive clear
title to the property.
You are encouraged to
investigate the exist-
ence, priority, and size
of outstanding liens
that may exist on this
property by contacting
the county recorder's
office or a title insur-
ance company, either
of which may charge
you a fee for this in-
formation. If you con-
sult either of these re-
sources, you should be
aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
(916)939-0772 for in-
formation regarding the
trustee's sale or visit
this Internet Web site
www.nationwidepost-
ing.com for information
regarding the sale of
this property, using the
file number assigned to
this case, 17-01463. In-
formation about post-
ponements that are
very short in duration
or that occur close in
time to the scheduled
sale may not immedi-
ately be reflected in the
telephone information
or on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
Date: 05/22/2018 AT-
TORNEY LENDER
SERVICES, INC. DI-
ANE WEIFENBACH,
TRUSTEE SALE OF-
FICER 5120 E. LaP-
alma Avenue, #209
Anaheim, CA 92807
Telephone: 714-695-
6 6 3 7 S a l e s L i n e :
(916)939-0772 Sales
Website: www.nation-
wideposting.com This
office is attempting to
collect a debt and any
information obtained
will be used for that
purpose. NPP0333372
To: CULVER CITY
NEWS 05/31/2018,
0 6 / 0 7 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 1 4 / 2 0 1 8
Culver  City  News-
5 / 3 1 , 6 / 7 , 1 4 / 2 0 1 8 -
6 5 8 4 4
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NOTICE OF
PETITION TO
ADMINISTER

ESTATE OF AGNES
AGZARIAN
Case No.

18STPB04998
To all heirs, beneficiar-
ies, creditors, contin-
gent creditors, and per-
sons who may other-
wise be interested in
the will or estate, or
both, of AGNES AG-
ZARIAN
A P E T I T I O N F O R
PROBATE has been
filed by Anita Yvonne
Agzarian and Gustavo
Rendon in the Superi-
or Court of California,
C o u n t y o f L O S
A N G E L E S .
THE PETITION FOR
PROBATE requests
that Anita Yvonne Ag-
zarian and Gustavo
Rendon be appointed
as personal represent-
ative to administer the
estate of the decedent.
THE PETITION re-
quests the decedent's
will and codicils, if any,
be admitted to probate.
The will and any codi-
cils are available for
examination in the file
kept by the court.
THE PETITION re-
quests authority to ad-
minister the estate un-
der the Independent
Administration of Es-
tates Act. (This author-
ity will allow the per-
sonal representative to
take many act ions
without obtaining court
approval. Before tak-
ing certain very import-
ant actions, however,
the personal represent-
ative will be required to
give notice to inter-
ested persons unless
they have waived no-
tice or consented to the
proposed action.) The
independent adminis-
tration authority will be
granted unless an in-
terested person files an
objection to the peti-
tion and shows good
cause why the court
should not grant the
authority.
A HEARING on the pe-
tition will be held on
June 28, 2018 at 8:30
AM in Dept. No. 29 loc-
ated at 111 N. Hill St.,
L o s A n g e l e s , C A
9 0 0 1 2 .
IF YOU OBJECT to the
granting of the petition,
you should appear at
the hearing and state
your objections or file
written objections with
the court before the
hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person
or by your attorney.
IF YOU ARE A CRED-
ITOR or a contingent
credi tor of the de-
cedent, you must file
your claim with the
court and mail a copy
to the personal repres-
entative appointed by
the court within the
later of either (1) four
months from the date
of first issuance of let-
ters to a general per-
sonal representative,
as defined in section
58(b) of the California
Probate Code, or (2)
60 days from the date
of mailing or personal
delivery to you of a no-
tice under section 9052
of the California Pro-
bate Code.
Other California stat-
utes and legal author-
i ty may affect your
rights as a creditor.
You may want to con-
sult with an attorney
knowledgeable in Cali-
fornia law.
YOU MAY EXAMINE
the fi le kept by the
court. If you are a per-
son interested in the
estate, you may file
with the court a Re-
quest for Special No-
tice (form DE-154) of
the filing of an invent-
ory and appraisal of es-
tate assets or of any
petition or account as
provided in Probate
Code section 1250. A
Request for Special
Notice form is avail-
able from the court
clerk.
Attorney for petitioner:
PHILLIP L
TANGALAKIS ESQ
SBN 78379
T A N G A L A K I S &
T A N G A L A K I S
4264 OVERLAND AVE
CULVER CITY CA
90230
CN949876  AGZA-RI-
AN Jun 7,14,21, 2018
Culver  City  News-
6/7,14,212018-  65961
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Attorney for petitioner:
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should not grant the
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9 0 0 1 2 .
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FICTITIOUS
BUSINESS NAME

STATEMENT
2018-1124816

The following person is
doing business as: 1.
ES3P 2. Extraordinar-
i ly  S imple  3.  Ex-
traordinarily  Simple
3P, 269 S. Beverly Dr.,
#478, Beverly Hills, CA
90212. Reg is t ran t :
Michelle T. Hori, 269 S.
Bever ly Dr . , #478,
B e v e r l y H i l l s , C A
90212. This business is
conducted by: Individu-
al. The date registrant
started to transact busi-
ness under the ficti-
tious business name or
names listed above:
N/A. Signed: Michelle
T. Hori. This statement
was f i led wi th the
County Recorder Of-
fice: 5/21/2018. Notice
— This Fictitious Name
Statement expires five
years from the date it
was filed in the office of
the County Recorder
Office. A new Fictitious
Business Name State-
ment must be filed be-
fore that time. The fil-
ing of this statement
does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this
state of a Fictit ious
Business Name in viol-
ation of the rights of
another under federal,
state or common law
(see Section 14411
et.seq., Business and
Professions Code).
Gardena Valley News-
6 /7 ,14 ,21 ,28 /2018-
66037
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NOTICE OF TRUST-
EE'S SALE Trustee
S a l e N o . :
00000007382088 Title
O r d e r N o . : 7 3 0 -
1 8 0 1 5 1 1 - 7 0
FHA/VA/PMI No.: AT-
TENTION RECORD-
ER: THE FOLLOW-
ING REFERENCE TO
AN ATTACHED SUM-
MARY APPLIES ONLY
T O C O P I E S
PROVIDED TO THE
TRUSTOR, NOT TO
T H I S R E C O R D E D
ORIGINAL NOTICE.
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST,
DATED 11/22/2004.
UNLESS YOU TAKE
ACTION TO PRO-
TECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE
SOLD AT A PUBLIC
SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. BARRETT
DAFFIN FRAPPIER
TREDER and WEISS,
LLP, as duly appointed
Trustee under and pur-
suant to Deed of Trust
R e c o r d e d o n
12/01/2004 as Instru-
ment No. 04 3097522
of official records in the
office of the County
R e c o r d e r o f L O S
ANGELES Coun ty ,
State of CALIFORNIA.
EXECUTED BY: VIC-
TORIA VAZQUEZ, A
MARRIED WOMAN,
AS HER SOLE AND
SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, WILL SELL AT
PUBLIC AUCTION TO
HIGHEST BIDDER
F O R C A S H ,
C A S H I E R ' S
CHECK/CASH EQUI-
VALENT or other form
of payment authorized
by California Civil Code
2924h(b), (payable at
time of sale in lawful
money of the United
Sta tes) . DATE OF
SALE: 07 /16 /2018
TIME OF SALE: 11:00
AM PLACE OF SALE:
By the fountain located
at 400 Civic Center
Plaza, Pomona, CA
91766. STREET AD-
DRESS and other com-
mon designation, i f
any, of the real prop-
erty described above is
purported to be: 4026
COOGAN CIRCLE,
CULVER CITY, CALI-
FORNIA 90232 APN#:
4208-029-032 The land
referred to in this Re-
port is situated in the
City of Culver City,
County of Los Angeles,
State of California, and
is described as follows:
Parcel 1 Lot 47, of
Tract No. 34390, in the
City of Culver City,
County of Los Angeles,
State of California, as
per map recorded in
Book 891 Page(s) 97
to 100 inclusive of
Maps, in the Office of
the County Recorder of
said County. Parcel 2 A
non-exclusive ease-
ment for ingress and
egress, roof overhang
and other purposes, in,
over and across the
Southeasterly 5 00 feet
of Lot 48 of said Tract
No 34390, as shown in
that certain document
recorded November 1,
1978, as Instrument No
78-1214497, Official
Records. APN: 4208-
029-032 The under-
signed Trustee dis-
claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
the street address and
other common desig-
nation, if any, shown
herein. Said sale will
be made, but without
covenant or warranty,
e x p r e s s e d o r
implied,regarding title,
possession, or encum-
brances, to pay the re-
maining principal sum
of the note(s) secured
by said Deed of Trust,
with interest thereon,
as provided in said
note(s), advances, un-
der the terms of said
Deed of Trust, fees,
charges and expenses
of the Trustee and of
the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust. The
total amount of the un-
paid balance of the ob-
ligation secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable estimated
costs, expenses and
advances at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale is
$413,094.25. The be-
neficiary under said
Deed of Trust hereto-
fore executed and de-
livered to the under-
signed a written De-
claration of Default and
Demand for Sale, and
a written Notice of De-
fault and Election to
Sell. The undersigned
caused said Notice of
Default and Election to
Sell to be recorded in
the county where the
real property is located.
NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you
are considering bid-
ding on this property li-
en, you should under-
stand that there are
risks involved in bid-
ding at a trustee auc-
tion. You will be bid-
ding on a lien, not on
the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at
a trustee auction does
not automatically en-
title you to free and
clear ownership of the
property. You should
also be aware that the
lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If
you are the highest bid-
der at the auction, you
are or may be respons-
ible for paying off all li-
ens senior to the lien
being auctioned off, be-
fore you can receive
clear title to the prop-
erty. You are encour-
aged to investigate the
existence, priority, and
size of outstanding li-
ens that may exist on
this property by con-
tacting the county re-
corder's office or a title
insurance company,
either of which may
charge you a fee for
this information. If you
consult either of these
resources, you should
be aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
800-758-8052 for in-
formation regarding the
trustee's sale or visit
this Internet Web site
www.homesearch.com
for information regard-
ing the sale of this
property, using the file
number assigned to
t h i s c a s e
00000007382088. In-
formation about post-
ponements that are
very short in duration
or that occur close in
time to the scheduled
sale may not immedi-
ately be reflected in the
telephone information
or on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
FOR TRUSTEE SALE
I N F O R M A T I O N
PLEASE CALL: XOME
8 0 0 - 7 5 8 - 8 0 5 2
www.homesearch.com
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP as
T r u s t e e 2 0 9 5 5
Pathfinder Road, Suite
300 Diamond Bar, CA
91765 (866) 795-1852
Dated : 06 /05 /2018
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP IS
ACTING AS A DEBT
C O L L E C T O R A T -
TEMPTING TO COL-
LECT A DEBT. ANY
INFORMATION OB-
T A I N E D W I L L B E
U S E D F O R T H A T
PURPOSE. A-4660033
0 6 / 1 4 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 2 1 / 2 0 1 8 ,
0 6 / 2 8 / 2 0 1 8
Culver  City  News-
6 / 1 4 , 2 1 , 2 8 / 2 0 1 8 -
6 6 0 9 0
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of the Trustee and of
the trusts created by
said Deed of Trust. The
total amount of the un-
paid balance of the ob-
ligation secured by the
property to be sold and
reasonable estimated
costs, expenses and
advances at the time of
the initial publication of
the Notice of Sale is
$413,094.25. The be-
neficiary under said
Deed of Trust hereto-
fore executed and de-
livered to the under-
signed a written De-
claration of Default and
Demand for Sale, and
a written Notice of De-
fault and Election to
Sell. The undersigned
caused said Notice of
Default and Election to
Sell to be recorded in
the county where the
real property is located.
NOTICE TO POTEN-
TIAL BIDDERS: If you
are considering bid-
ding on this property li-
en, you should under-
stand that there are
risks involved in bid-
ding at a trustee auc-
tion. You will be bid-
ding on a lien, not on
the property itself. Pla-
cing the highest bid at
a trustee auction does
not automatically en-
title you to free and
clear ownership of the
property. You should
also be aware that the
lien being auctioned off
may be a junior lien. If
you are the highest bid-
der at the auction, you
are or may be respons-
ible for paying off all li-
ens senior to the lien
being auctioned off, be-
fore you can receive
clear title to the prop-
erty. You are encour-
aged to investigate the
existence, priority, and
size of outstanding li-
ens that may exist on
this property by con-
tacting the county re-
corder's office or a title
insurance company,
either of which may
charge you a fee for
this information. If you
consult either of these
resources, you should
be aware that the same
lender may hold more
than one mortgage or
deed of trust on the
property. NOTICE TO
PROPERTY OWNER:
The sale date shown
on this notice of sale
may be postponed one
or more times by the
mortgagee, beneficiary,
trustee, or a court, pur-
suant to Section 2924g
of the California Civil
Code. The law re-
quires that information
about trustee sale post-
ponements be made
available to you and to
the public, as a cour-
t esy to those no t
present at the sale. If
you w ish to lea rn
whether your sale date
has been postponed,
and, if applicable, the
rescheduled time and
date for the sale of this
property, you may call
800-758-8052 for in-
formation regarding the
trustee's sale or visit
this Internet Web site
www.homesearch.com
for information regard-
ing the sale of this
property, using the file
number assigned to
t h i s c a s e
00000007382088. In-
formation about post-
ponements that are
very short in duration
or that occur close in
time to the scheduled
sale may not immedi-
ately be reflected in the
telephone information
or on the Internet Web
site. The best way to
verify postponement in-
formation is to attend
the scheduled sale.
FOR TRUSTEE SALE
I N F O R M A T I O N
PLEASE CALL: XOME
8 0 0 - 7 5 8 - 8 0 5 2
www.homesearch.com
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP as
T r u s t e e 2 0 9 5 5
Pathfinder Road, Suite
300 Diamond Bar, CA
91765 (866) 795-1852
Dated : 06 /05 /2018
BARRETT DAFFIN
FRAPPIER TREDER
and WEISS, LLP IS
ACTING AS A DEBT
C O L L E C T O R A T -
TEMPTING TO COL-
LECT A DEBT. ANY
INFORMATION OB-
T A I N E D W I L L B E
U S E D F O R T H A T
PURPOSE. A-4660033
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0 6 / 2 8 / 2 0 1 8
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6 / 1 4 , 2 1 , 2 8 / 2 0 1 8 -
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O r d e r N o . : 7 3 0 -
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FHA/VA/PMI No.: AT-
TENTION RECORD-
ER: THE FOLLOW-
ING REFERENCE TO
AN ATTACHED SUM-
MARY APPLIES ONLY
T O C O P I E S
PROVIDED TO THE
TRUSTOR, NOT TO
T H I S R E C O R D E D
ORIGINAL NOTICE.
NOTE: THERE IS A
SUMMARY OF THE
I N F O R M A T I O N I N
THIS DOCUMENT AT-
TACHED. YOU ARE IN
DEFAULT UNDER A
DEED OF TRUST,
DATED 11/22/2004.
UNLESS YOU TAKE
ACTION TO PRO-
TECT YOUR PROP-
ERTY, IT MAY BE
SOLD AT A PUBLIC
SALE. IF YOU NEED
AN EXPLANATION OF
THE NATURE OF THE
P R O C E E D I N G
AGAINST YOU, YOU
SHOULD CONTACT A
LAWYER. BARRETT
DAFFIN FRAPPIER
TREDER and WEISS,
LLP, as duly appointed
Trustee under and pur-
suant to Deed of Trust
R e c o r d e d o n
12/01/2004 as Instru-
ment No. 04 3097522
of official records in the
office of the County
R e c o r d e r o f L O S
ANGELES Coun ty ,
State of CALIFORNIA.
EXECUTED BY: VIC-
TORIA VAZQUEZ, A
MARRIED WOMAN,
AS HER SOLE AND
SEPARATE PROP-
ERTY, WILL SELL AT
PUBLIC AUCTION TO
HIGHEST BIDDER
F O R C A S H ,
C A S H I E R ' S
CHECK/CASH EQUI-
VALENT or other form
of payment authorized
by California Civil Code
2924h(b), (payable at
time of sale in lawful
money of the United
Sta tes) . DATE OF
SALE: 07 /16 /2018
TIME OF SALE: 11:00
AM PLACE OF SALE:
By the fountain located
at 400 Civic Center
Plaza, Pomona, CA
91766. STREET AD-
DRESS and other com-
mon designation, i f
any, of the real prop-
erty described above is
purported to be: 4026
COOGAN CIRCLE,
CULVER CITY, CALI-
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port is situated in the
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Book 891 Page(s) 97
to 100 inclusive of
Maps, in the Office of
the County Recorder of
said County. Parcel 2 A
non-exclusive ease-
ment for ingress and
egress, roof overhang
and other purposes, in,
over and across the
Southeasterly 5 00 feet
of Lot 48 of said Tract
No 34390, as shown in
that certain document
recorded November 1,
1978, as Instrument No
78-1214497, Official
Records. APN: 4208-
029-032 The under-
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claims any liability for
any incorrectness of
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other common desig-
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